
Planetarium Dome TheaterTabulation Bid #:FB-24-019 Date: 10/30/2023 Page 1 of 2
 Vendor No.

Vendor Name ePlanetarium DIGISTAR Digitalis Education Solutions, Inc.

City, State Driftwood, TX Salt Lake City, Utah Bremerton, WA 

Phone # 855-347-2366 X 4 (801) 554-0049 360.616.8915

Email Address service@eplanetarium.com dsasich@es.com info@digitaliseducation.com

Contact Name Michael Hutchinson David Sasich Sales

Time   Vendor was Contacted _____ a.m. X  p.m. _____ a.m.  X p.m. _____ a.m.  X p.m.
Method Used to Contact Vendor X Email __ Phone __ Other X Email __ Phone __ Other X Email __ Phone __ Other

Minority Vendor Yes        No  Yes        No  Yes        No  

Item No. Description Qty UM Unit Price
(Copy formula as needed)   

Extension Unit Price
(Copy formula as needed)   

Extension Unit Price
(Copy formula as needed)   

Extension

1 6 Meter Discoevery Dome 4 pcs $11,400.00 $45,600.00
2 Air Blower for dome inflation 4 pcs $399.00 $1,596.00
3 Rover360 Mirror Projection System 4 pcs $13,560.00 $54,240.00
4 Four Wheel Dollie 4 pcs $375.00 $1,500.00

Total $102,936.00 $0.00 $0.00
no bid no bid
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 Vendor No.



Vendor Name starlab go-dome Arkansas SkyDome Planetarium
City, State Yulee, FL Houston, Texas Dallas, Texas

Phone # (904) 225-2228 501-314-9250
Email Address starlabassist@starlab.com info@go-dome.com observatory@arkansassky.com
Contact Name Sales Sales Sales

Time   Vendor was Contacted _____ a.m. X  p.m. _____ a.m.  X p.m. _____ a.m. X  p.m.
Method Used to Contact Vendor X Email __ Phone __ Other X Email __ Phone __ Other X Email __ Phone __ Other

Minority Vendor Yes        No  Yes        No  Yes        No  

Item No. Description Qty UM Unit Price
(Copy formula as needed)   

Extension Unit Price
(Copy formula as needed)   

Extension Unit Price
(Copy formula as needed)   

Extension

Total $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
no bid no bid no bid


